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          Date: 03-01-2024 

 

Dear Esteemed Members, 

  
Wish you a very happy new year! 
 
Mark your calendars for an extraordinary event! On the 5th of January 2024, 
starting from 11:00 AM  at Hotel Ramada Plaza, Lucknow we will present a series 
of path-breaking initiatives from IIISLA  platform to unleash  a new era at the 
Indian Institute of insurance Surveyors, and loss Assessors (IIISLA). 
 
Join us for the following momentous events:- 
 
1-Inauguration of the IIISLA E-Library & E-Journal: - Witness the unveiling of our 
advanced E-Library and E-Journal. These cutting-edge platforms will serve as an 
invaluable resource  of knowledge and information to common members in their 
day to day profesional endeavour. 
 
2-Demonstration of the UDIN System in Survey & assessment Reporting:- Explore 
the revolutionary Unified Digital Identification Number (UDIN) system, set to 
transform survey reporting. Attend the demonstration to experience how this 
system enhances credibility and efficiency in reporting. 
 
3- ISO 9001-2015 Compliance at IIISLA: - Experience our commitment to 
excellence as we demonstrate compliance with ISO 9001-2015 standards. This 
showcases our dedication to maintain   quality and system driven standards across 
all operations. 
 
4- Demonstration of Course Syllabus for Surveyors for Motor and Principal 
Practices in General Insurance Ecosystem:- Discover the specially curated course  
syllabus for training ,education and  examination  for promotion to Licentiate, 
Associate and Fellow  focusing on Motor and Principal Practices of General 
Insurance Business in India  ( common to all branches) . This session is aimed to 
equip surveyors with SOP  practices vital for continuous professional development. 
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5-  Demonstration of Unified Claims Interface(UCI) - IIISLA IT Project:-  Get an 
exclusive look at the IIISLA IT Project, a significant step towards technological 
advancement within all arms of our institute. It is aimed to deal  with not only   
internal and external operations but also system generated responses to address 
members grievances and interaction with other stakeholders in the gambit of 
survey & assessment processes. 
 
For those who are unable to attend in person, a Zoom link will be provided 
separately to ensure all members can participate remotely. 
 
Your presence and engagement in these momentous events are highly valued. 
Please stay tuned for further details and the Zoom access link, which will be shared 
in due course. 
 
 
We eagerly anticipate your participation in this historic occasion, as together; we 
embark on a transformative journey at IIISLA. 
 
With Warm regards,  

 
Nirmal Tripathi 
Secretary-IIISLA 
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